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March 20—As the great strategist, revolutionary, and 
supporter of Abraham Lincoln, Dr. Sun Yat-sen once 
said, “Acting is easy; thinking is hard.” Dr. Sun wished 
to shock his Chinese contemporaries into the realiza-
tion—that we must also elicit from our contempo-
raries—that their fundamental weakness is not that they 
fail to act, or to react, to world crises, but rather, that 
they fail to think of themselves as acting on the world 
as a whole, through particular and even individual ac-
tions based on a shared idea of humanity. The Ten Prin-
ciples of a New Security and Development Architecture  
that inform the May 24-25 conference of the Schiller 
Institute,  demand the kind of “hard thinking” which, 
if embraced, places each thinker in immediate dialogue 
with the changing landscape of world history expressed 
in the emerging communities of discourse that have 
emerged in the Global South, and are emerging in pock-
ets of the Anglosphere itself.

There is a greater power now available to the citi-
zens of the Anglosphere than at any time before, but the 
mind must be alive in order to wield it. That assertion 
runs counter to the everyday “narrative” that is accept-
ed and repeated, especially by those who claim to be 
“politicized,” that “the deep state is everywhere” and 
is omnipotent. For any citizen in today’s trans-Atlantic 
sphere, successfully proposing and enacting lawful and 
productive change in foreign and domestic policy re-
quires one to first recognize that you can’t ignore that 
“there’s a war going on.” The Anglosphere, terrified 
by the two-and-a-half-hour dialogue of U.S. President 
Donald Trump and Russian President Vladimir Putin 
on March 18, and the already discussed possibility of 
a meeting between the two leaders in Saudi Arabia “in 
the near future,” is increasingly attacking its own pop-
ulation. This can most readily be seen in Europe, with 
the at first gradual and now headlong dismantling of 
parliamentary democracy, under the Orwellian banner 
of “rearmament for peace.”

On the Trump-Putin exchange, Russian strategic 

analyst Fyodor Lukyanov remarked that “real diplo-
macy has returned.” He cautioned, however, against 
two impending illusions. “One is the illusion that ev-
erything will be resolved quickly and painlessly, and 
the other is the cynical belief that any agreement is 
fundamentally unattainable.” The “mainstream me-
dia” of the multiple intelligence agencies are finding 
it increasingly difficult to maintain the charade of the 
“War Party,” even when the previously “sure bet” of 
“helping our friends in the Mideast by starting wars” 
is invoked. In America, there is little enthusiasm for 
the bombing of Yemen, and far less enthusiasm for a 
war with Iran, including from—and perhaps especially 
from—much of the Trump support base.

Don’t let your mind be disassembled by the dis-
semblers. Don’t be bamboozled, bum-rushed, or bush-
whacked by media misdirection, as is, for example, 
being done around the release of the 80,000 pages of 
the President John F. Kennedy assassination files. No 
one has had time to read or digest them, but “respon-
sible media” assure us that there’s nothing there, even 
though they weren’t released for six decades.

The Los Angeles Times  “reported” on March 18, “A 
cursory review of the release did not immediately yield 
any major revelations or challenge the well-established 
facts that Kennedy was fatally shot by Lee Harvey 
Oswald while traveling in an open-topped convertible 
through Dallas. However, the vast trove of documents 
will take significant time for historians and The Times 
to comb through.” In other words, “we haven’t read 
them, and we know you won’t, so stick to your knitting 
until further notice from the authorities as to what you 
are instructed to think.”

But it’s not necessarily what’s in the files that holds 
the most interest. It may very well be what the files 
don’t show, and the way they don’t show it, that may 
be more intriguing, as well as useful. For example: Al-
len Dulles, the head of the CIA from 1953 to 1961, 
whom President Kennedy fired for actions undertaken 
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(not only with respect to Cuba, but possibly Congo as 
well), was appointed to the Warren Commission inves-
tigating the President’s assassination. “Since its found-
ing, to date, the chief defect of the Central Intelligence 
Agency is typified by Allen Dulles’s tenure as its Di-
rector of Intelligence…. To a large degree, the case of 
Dulles and of the FBI’s intrusion into foreign intelli-
gence functions are key to everything fundamentally 
wrong with the post-1939 functioning of the U.S. intel-
ligence services.… Although there is no doubt that Al-
len Dulles was committed to the U.S.A.’s winning the 
war against Nazi Germany, he and his brother John had 
previously been admirers of Adolf Hitler since the late 
1920s…. During the 1930s, Allen Dulles was a mem-
ber of the Board of Directors of Schroeder’s Bank, the 
‘piggy bank’ used by Hjalmar Schacht to conduit funds 
raised to bring Hitler to power in Germany. During and 
after the war, the Dulles brothers played the leading 
part in sponsoring the establishment of the post-war 
Nazi international. Insofar as Nazi Germany became 
the military adversary of the Anglo-American forces, 
Allen Dulles worked without doubt for Hitler’s defeat; 
however, in political philosophy of practice, the Dull-
eses were Nazi, before and after the war…. If one were 
obliged to select a single postwar occurrence which 
locates Dulles’s influence on the failures of the U.S. 
intelligence community, it is the coverup of the assas-
sination of President John F. Kennedy: the failure to 
detect and disrupt the operations before the fact, and 
the massive, arbitrary coverup after the fact.” Lyndon 
LaRouche, founder of Executive Intelligence Review, 
and his associates, who were in working contact with 
attorney Jim Garrison in the late 1970s and early ’80s, 
made that statement in 1984. LaRouche then added, 
“The evidence developed by New Orleans District 
Attorney, Jim Garrison, was massive. This evidence 
is variously corroborated by and significantly supple-
mented by evidence assembled by other investigators, 
including the internal private news agency headed by 
candidate LaRouche.”

Senator Frank Church’s Select Committee To Study 
Governmental Operations with Respect to Intelligence 
Activities issued a November 1975 document, “Al-
leged Assassination Plots Involving Foreign Leaders,” 
which cites a cable personally sent by Allen Dulles 
to the CIA Station Officer in Leopoldville on August 
26, 1960, concerning the first leader of the newly in-
dependent Democratic Republic of the Congo, Patrice 

Lumumba, who was assassinated on January 17, 1961 
(capitals all in the original): “REMOVAL MUST BE 
AN URGENT AND PRIME OBJECTIVE…….(Name 
indicated by •••••) A HIGH PRIORITY OF OUR CO-
VERT ACTION. YOU CAN ACT ON YOUR OWN 
AUTHORITY WHERE TIME DOES NOT PERMIT 
REFERRAL HERE.”

It is not necessary to find in the 80,000-plus pages 
of the Kennedy files a smoking gun, whose smoke 
may have dissipated decades ago. It will be a revela-
tion for the people of the Anglosphere, especially as 
the Robert F. Kennedy and Martin Luther King, Jr. 
files are also released, that their thinking about every-
thing was changed by the assassinations. The assas-
sinations were the major engine of a cultural paradigm 
shift from which the trans-Atlantic world will never 
recover, until not only those files are released, but also 
until people reject the very idea that the files should 
have ever been kept from the American people in the 
first place.

The Church Committee’s “Alleged Assassination 
Plots Against Foreign Leaders” study prompts several 
questions; for example, “Who killed Israel’s [Prime 
Minister] Yitzhak Rabin, really?” in 1995. When we 
look at post-Rabin Israel, and post-[PLO chairman 
Yasser] Arafat Palestine—another death that should be 
more carefully scrutinized—not only with respect to 
the present actions in Gaza and West Bank, but the pos-
sibility of war with Iran, and perhaps with others, what 
must we learn about the longer-term cultural effects of 
silence in the face of criminal execution of leaders?

Every action, no matter how small, or even small-
minded, which seeks to impact “the course of contem-
porary policies and events,” is embedded, now, in an 
epochal change, being shaped by conversations involv-
ing the nations of Russia, China, the United States, the 
BRICS nations, and others. Thermonuclear weapons, 
and the danger of thermonuclear war, have in part de-
termined that. We, the people, must find a way, not 
only to impact the present world-discussion, and its 
immediate future pursuit of the path to either war or 
peace, but also to determine an outcome for the hu-
man race other than extinction. What gives us not only 
the right, but the responsibility to do that, is a shared 
vision, “A Beautiful Vision for Humanity in Times of 
Great Turbulence!” That is the title for the May 24-25 
conference, and it is the mission to which those who 
would make the world better, joyfully aspire.
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